
Room 1 – Week 2 
Ms. Motta 
 
Yeehaw… week 2 was a hoe down of a week. We made life sized 
penguins and some desert spiders. For Color War the campers had 
a chubby bunny contest, a line-dancing contest, and a three-
legged race. We had 2 new additions to our Pen Gu Island 
penguins, they are all getting along great. Our penguins showed 
great sportsmanship on Western Day they all came dressed in 
their best cowboy attire. Can’t wait to see what next week has in 
store for us. 
 
 - Ms. Motta and Ms. Zayas 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Room 2 – Week 2 
Ms. Rivera & Mr. Lieberman 
 
Howdy everyone!  Room 2 had a blast with Western week!  Along 
with our Color War games, we had fun being creative building our 
very own popsicle-stick cowboys.  We got a little silly putting 
together some crazy socks too!  We also worked on our 
sportsmanship and teamwork with some kickball and starred in 
our own summer camp version of Wheel of Fortune.  It’s been a 
great time and next week is going to be even more fun! 
 
 - Ms. Rivera and Mr. Lieberman  

Room 8 – Week 2 
Mr. Malka 
 
The Sandlot 
 
Tada!  This week we really enjoyed doing magic tricks! We even 
researched how to perform a few card tricks.  We created some fast 
and aerodynamic paper airplanes with amazing designs.  Every day 
we are making new friends and enjoying playing basketball 
together.  We also made and painted some ping-pong poppers!  We 
are looking forward to next week! 
 
 - Mr. Malka 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Room 10 - Week 2 
Ms. Crawford & Ms. Cope 
 
What a wonderful week we’ve had!  Our group has doubled with all 
of the overnighters joining camp this week!  All the campers have 
enjoyed making new friends.  We each created a flower to hang 
around the room.  Each camper choose their favorite flower colors 
and no two were alike.  Every camper made and personalized either 
a cowboy or cowgirl when participating in western day.  The 
campers especially enjoyed learning a western dance with the C. I. 
T’s.  To give a special western experience, the week ended with a 
trip to the rodeo.  
 
 - Ms. Crawford and Ms. Cope 
 
 
 
 
 

 


